
April 9, Psalms 45 vs 10-17, Forget your people and your father’s house; the King will desire 
your beauty


Our precious Heavenly Husband, we want to listen to you, because you are calling us out from 
our past. You are doing a new work -  a work based on a love relationship with you. We don’t 
forget for forgetting sake, we forget because we’re so in love with you that nothing else from 
our past matters. We can move on because you have forgiven us and cleanse us from all 
unrighteousness. We can be fully satisfied in you, because we are perfectly loved in you - 
through the work of Jesus. Those who are truly rich, spiritually, will join us, and be participants 
with the same grace that we are benefiting from. We are daughters of the King and he has 
made us glorious within. We are clothed with the righteousness of Christ, covered with His 
riches, lavished on us, from our One who became poor to make us rich. We are pure and virgin 
spiritually We love feel a godly sort of jealousy within us that causes remain in the simplicity of 
pure devotion to you - our Heavenly Husband. We are espoused to Jesus, and the Holy Spirit 
is the down payment, as it were the engagement ring of the good things to come. We will enter 
in through the Spirit to our palace in heaven. It belongs to us  because we are seated with 
Jesus in heavenly places. Yes, we will enter in with shouts of joy today!!!

 In place of our fathers, (our former authority structure under the law) , will be our sons, (the 
spiritual fruit that comes from abiding in Christ). Yes, this spiritual fruit will rule as princes in the 
earth - yes, we’ve not been given a spirit of fear, but of power, and loving a clear mind, 
because we have been made complete in you the head of all principalities and powers. As 
Mary in Bethany our act of worship will also be remembered throughout all generations, 
because it was given from heaven, yes, our praise will start now and continue forever.


Themes of this prayer and the references:


Forgetting what’s behind because you’re in rapture with a love relationship with Jesus - Phil 
3:13


“Brethren, I do not regard myself as having laid hold of it yet; but one thing I do: forgetting what 
lies behind and reaching forward to what lies ahead,” 

Protected by godly jealousy - 2 Cor 11:2-3


“For I am jealous for you with a godly jealousy; for I betrothed you to one husband, so that to 
Christ I might present you as a pure virgin. 3 But I am afraid that, as the serpent deceived Eve 
by his craftiness, your minds will be led astray from the simplicity and purity of devotion to 
Christ.” 

Sealed by the Holy Spirit, who is the engagement ring of the good things to come - Eph 
1:13-14


13 In Him, you also, after listening to the message of truth, the gospel of your salvation—having 
also believed, you were sealed in Him with the Holy Spirit of promise, 14 who is given as a 
pledge of our inheritance, with a view to the redemption of God’s own possession, to the praise 
of His glory. 

Being dead to our former authority structure under the law through the body of Christ - and 
now through abiding in him as the source of all things, we can bear lasting spiritual fruit that is 
victorious over all principalities and powers - Rom 7:1-4




4 Therefore, my brethren, you also were made to die to the Law through the body of Christ, so 
that you might be joined to another, to Him who was raised from the dead, in order that we 
might bear fruit for God. 

And John 15


No longer do I call you slaves, for the slave does not know what his master is doing; but I have 
called you friends, for all things that I have heard from My Father I have made known to you. 16 
You did not choose Me but I chose you, and appointed you that you would go and bear fruit, 
and that your fruit would remain, 

Our worship being memorialized, because it’s sourced out of eternal spring, just as Mary’s was 
in Bethany - Luke 7:36-50



